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Predicting Early Maladaptive Schemas Using Baumrind’s Parenting Styles
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Background: Families play an essential role in maintaining children’s mental, social, and physical health. The family provides the first 
and the most important social context for human development.
Objectives: The present study aimed to predict early maladaptive schemas using Baumrind’s parenting styles (root development).
Patients and Methods: A total of 357 undergraduate students of Islamic Azad University, Urmia Branch, Iran, were selected through 
random cluster sampling during 2013 and 2014. The students were assessed using the Schema Questionnaire-Short Form (SQ-SF) and the 
Baumrind’s parenting styles inventories.
Results: The result of regression analysis showed that Baumrind’s parenting styles are significant predictors of early maladaptive schemas 
(P < 0.001).
Conclusions: The authoritative parenting style has some features such as showing high levels of warmth or encouraging kids to express 
their own possibly divergent opinions. The authoritarian parenting style, however, possesses traits such as heartlessness, impassiveness, 
strictness, and lack of attention to the children’s developmental needs, which is not acceptable.
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1. Background
Families play an essential role in maintaining children’s 

mental, social, and physical health. The family provides 
the first and the most important social context for hu-
man development. During the normal development of 
every child, we see a wide range of cognitive, emotional, 
and social changes. Almost all children will have prob-
lems during their development and this, in compatibil-
ity with the accompanying changes, stress, and conflicts, 
can cause behavioral, emotional, and learning problems. 
Most behavioral problems in children reflect the com-
plex individual situations among family members, par-
ticularly the parents. In other words, the child’s behav-
ioral problems are due to the damaged relationships of 
the family members with each other and are associated 
with the incorrect training methods of parents and their 
defective interactions with their children.

The term “parenting” is derived from “pario”, which 
means “life”. The purpose of a parenting style is to help 
parents educate their children and reflect their attitudes 
toward their children and at the same time, execute the 
rules and regulations enacted by them. Family, as a pri-
mary context, provides the necessary resources and op-
portunities for the healthy development of children (1). 
Appropriate parenting skills are the key variables that pre-
dict children’s positive outcomes in the first and middle 
years of life (1). The purpose of positive parenting styles is 

to shape the mental character and strengthen the compe-
tence of the child. The importance of these issues has led 
researchers to discuss parenting styles and offer a variety 
of methods (2) among which we can refer to the theories 
of Ericsson, Baumrind, and Young. Baumrind proposed 
three styles of parenting based on the two features of re-
questing (this refers to the attributes of control, monitor-
ing, and expected mature behavior from the child) and 
being responsive (including support, love, and accep-
tance of the child) (3). In the authoritative style, parental 
demands are met at high levels (4) and these demands 
are reasonable (5). Parents allow their children to com-
ment and enjoy independence and freedom of thought, 
and a warm and cordial relationship exists between the 
child and the parents at a high level (2). They allow their 
children to express their ideas, and provide the grounds 
for their future progress. This style of parenting can lead 
to increased self-regulation, compliance, and obtaining a 
college education (6). Nevertheless, parents who practice 
the authoritarian parenting style have a rigid set of rules 
and illustrate heartlessness, lack of attention to the devel-
opmental needs of the child, low emotional support, and 
strict discipline (6). This style is associated with features 
such as reduced admission and high control that create 
underlying problems such as weak social skills, low self-
esteem, and aggressiveness, and will prevent them from 
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becoming highly educated individuals (1). Parents using 
the permissive style have low expectations from their 
children (6). Acceptance, high responsiveness, relaxation 
in social attitudes, discipline, and customs (7), and less 
control from parents cause underlying problems such as 
aggression, low self-control, negligence, emotional prob-
lems, school dropout, and tendency toward drugs and 
crime; however, they also result in high confidence (1). In 
this parenting style, abundant love substitutes punish-
ment by parents, both of which, in turn, may be devas-
tating (8). Young suggests a subset of schemas that are 
called primary dysfunctional schemas (9). The schema-
focused approach places the main emphasis on under-
standing the deepest levels of cognition, which is prima-
ry dysfunctional schemas, rather on automatic thoughts 
and underlying assumptions. Models that are focused on 
schemes define primary dysfunctional schemas as inclu-
sive and extensive subjects with regard to personal and 
individual relationships with others that are created in 
childhood and last throughout a person’s life and may 
be extended with a degree of inefficiency (9). Primary 
dysfunctional schemas are fundamentally implicit and 
unconscious contexts that are retained by the individual. 
Primary dysfunctional schemas are used as a model for 
processing experiences throughout their lives as well as 
for behaviors, thoughts, feelings, and their relationships 
with other people. In contrast to the underlying assump-
tions, primary dysfunctional schemas are often uncondi-
tional, and therefore, very inflexible. Essentially, primary 
dysfunctional schemas are authentic representations of 
early childhood unpleasant experiences (9). According to 
Young, the primary dysfunctional schemas are among the 
main causes of pathology generated through interper-
sonal experiences with close people such as parents (9). 
Peers are also affected by the deprivation of basic needs. 
These schemas represent the child’s sense of self. Primary 
dysfunctional schemas are associated with psychologic 
distress levels and personality disorders. When primary 
dysfunctional schemas are activated due to events, the 
levels of emotion created directly and indirectly lead to 
various forms of psychologic distress including depres-
sion, anxiety, loneliness, anorexia nervosa, conflicts, and 
interpersonal relationship problems (9).

Young et al. identified 18 negative schemas that prog-
ress in early life (10). They stated that these schemas are 
divided according to five unsatisfied emotional needs 
called schema areas (10). The first area is disconnection 
and rejection. The people, whose schemas take place in 
this area, cannot interact in a secure and satisfying at-
tachment with others. The schemas of this area include 
abandonment/instability, mistrust/abuse, emotional 
deprivation, defectiveness/shame, and social isolation/
alienation. The second area is impaired autonomy and 
performance. In this area, the person’s expectation from 
himself/herself and environmental interaction with her/
his tangible abilities consist of separation, survival, and 
functioning independently, or to work successfully. The 

schemas of this area include dependence/incompetence, 
vulnerability to harm or illness, enmeshment/undevel-
oped self, and failure. The third area is impaired limits. In 
this area, individuals’ internal constraints have not devel-
oped sufficiently in terms of mutual respect and restraint. 
The schemas of this area include entitlement/grandiosity 
and insufficient self-control/discipline. The fourth area is 
other-direction. These individuals prioritize the satisfy-
ing of the needs of others in order to receive emotional 
support, maintain ongoing relationships, and avoid 
revenge. The schemas of this area include subjugation, 
self-sacrifice, and approval-seeking/recognition-seeking. 
The fifth area is over-vigilance/inhibition. In this area, in-
dividuals place extreme emphasis on rejection of feelings 
and impulses in order to act according to their inflexible 
and internal rules even at the cost of losing joy and peace 
of mind. The schemas of this area include negativity/pes-
simism, emotional inhibition, unrelenting standards/
hypercriticalness, and punitiveness (10).

Young and Brown argued that an individual’s unique 
experiences in childhood contribute to and influence 
the development of a distinct set of core beliefs about 
themselves and others, which they called early maladap-
tive schemas (11). Young believes that any childhood ex-
perience can have an effect on the formation of early mal-
adaptive schemas (12).

2. Objectives
The hypothesis of this research was whether Baum-

rind’s parenting styles (evolutionary root) were predic-
tors of early maladaptive schemas.

3. Materials and Methods
In this descriptive-correlational study, samples were se-

lected through cluster random sampling method. A total 
of 357 male and female students of Islamic Azad Univer-
sity, Urmia Branch, Iran, were selected using the Morgan 
table during 2013-2014. Due to the purpose and nature of 
this research, the best way to gather the needed informa-
tion was to complete an inventory; therefore, two inven-
tories were used in this study.

3.1. Early Maladaptive Schema Inventory-Short 
Form

The Early Maladaptive Schema inventory by Young 
and Brown was designed to measure early maladaptive 
schemas (11). The Early Maladaptive Schema inventory-
short form (SQ-SF) was created because of its briefness; 
however, it is used as an instrument to measure primary 
maladaptive schemas. The SQ-SF includes 75 items of the 
205 items in the original form. These 75 items questioned 
15 early maladaptive schemas of emotional deprivation 
(sentences 1 to 5), abandonment (sentences 6 to 10), 
mistrust/abuse (sentences 11 to 15), social isolation (sen-
tences 16 to 20), defectiveness/shame (sentences 21 to 25), 
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failure (sentences 26 to 30), dependence/incompetence 
(sentences 31 to 35), vulnerability to harm or illness (sen-
tences 36 to 40), enmeshment (sentences 41 to 45), subju-
gation (sentences 46 to 50), self-sacrifice (sentences 51 to 
55), emotional inhibition (sentences 56 to 60), unrelent-
ing standards (sentences 61 to 65), entitlement (sentenc-
es 66 to 70), and insufficient self-control/self-discipline 
(sentences 71 to 75). Each one of these 75 scales of the 
SQ-SF is graded on a six-point scale as follows: 1) Totally 
wrong about me; 2) Almost wrong about me; 3) Slightly 
more true to false; 4) Almost true; 5) Truer about me/truer 
than me; and 6) Fully described me. The higher scores on 
each item indicate the presence of a wide range of early 
maladaptive schemas in the answerer (13). The reliability 
and validity of this instrument have been demonstrated 
in several studies (14). The Farsi version of this inventory 
was standardized in the University of Tehran, Iran, by 
Divandari et al. (15). Therefore, the internal consistency 
obtained using Cronbach’s alpha was 0.97 in the female 
population and 0.98 in the male population (15).

3.2. Baumrind’s Parenting Inventory
Gunty and Buri designed the Baumrind’s parenting 

questionnaire based on the parental authority theory. It 
contains 30 questions with three scales (authoritative, 
authoritarian, and permissive), and each scale has ten 
items (16). Each item is rated based on the Likert scale 
from totally agree to totally disagree (5 scales) and is 
scored from zero to four (17). Gunty and Buri (16) report-
ed the reliability of this tool in mothers and fathers as 
respectively 0.81 and 0.77 for permissive style, 0.86 and 
0.85 for authoritarian style, and 0.78 and 0.88 for au-
thoritative style. They also used the discriminant valid-
ity method for questionnaire validity that obtained the 
following results: authoritarian mother has a reverse 
association with permissive mother (-0.38) and rational 
authority of mother (-0.48), also authoritarian father 
has a reverse association with permissive father (0.50) 
and rational authority of father (-0.52) (16). This ques-
tionnaire has been translated into Farsi and was used by 
Esfandiari (18). He reported a retest reliability coefficient 

of 0.69, 0.77, and 0.73 for permissive, authoritarian, and 
authoritative styles, respectively. Psychiatrists and psy-
chologists have also confirmed the validity of the ques-
tionnaire (18). Data analysis was performed using SPSS 
18 for Windows (SPSS Inc, Chicago, Illinois, the United 
States) and regression analysis. Since regression analysis 
was used in the present research, the aim was to make 
use of one or more variables to predict the criterion of 
one or more of the predictor variables.

4. Results
The mean ± standard deviations of the descriptive find-

ings of 357 samples are illustrated in Table 1. According 
to Table 1, the best parenting style was authoritarian, and 
most schemes belong to the fields of rejection and discon-
nection, impaired autonomy, and over-vigilance, respec-
tively. According to Table 2, based on the significance lev-
el of > 0.05, permissive parenting style could not explain 
early maladaptive schemas in the areas of rejection and 
disconnection, impaired autonomy and performance, 
impaired limits, other-direction, and over-vigilance and 
inhibition. However, authoritarian parenting style could 
positively predict the early maladaptive schemas in the 
area of rejection/disconnection. This approach could ex-
plain 1.3% of the variance of early maladaptive schemas 
in the area of rejection/disconnection that could also 
positively predict early maladaptive schemas in the area 
of other-direction. Baumrind’s authoritarian parenting 
style could explain 3.4% of the variance of early maladap-
tive schemas in the area of other-direction, but not for 
impaired performance and over-vigilance/inhibition. 
Finally, Baumrind’s authoritative parenting style could 
negatively predict early maladaptive schemas in the area 
of rejection or disconnection. Thus, this approach could 
explain 2.6% of the variance of early maladaptive schemas 
in the area of rejection and disconnection, and negatively 
explain other-direction. Baumrind’s authoritative par-
enting style could explain 3.4% of the variance of early 
maladaptive schemas in the area of other-direction, but 
not in impaired autonomy and performance, impaired 
limits, and over-vigilance/inhibition.

Table 1. Descriptive Data of Parenting Styles and Areas of Early Maladaptive Schemas

Variables Mean ± SD

Age 20.14 ± 10.17

Authoritative parenting style 26.64 ± 11.03

Permissive parenting style 16.61 ± 07.83

Authoritarian parenting style 16.86 ± 07.28

Disconnection and rejection area of early maladaptive schemas 48.91 ± 20.45

Impaired autonomy and performance area of early maladaptive schemas 37.52 ± 18.92

Impaired limits area of early maladaptive schemas 25.96 ± 11.56

Other-direction area of early maladaptive schemas 24.49 ± 10.75

Over-vigilance/inhibition area of early maladaptive schemas 27.60 ± 10.81
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Table 2. Regression Analysis of Baumrind’s Parenting Styles With Areas of Early Maladaptive Schemas

Variables F R R2 β B P Value

Permissive style and disconnection-rejection area 00.49 0.030 0.000 -0.030 52.48 0.48

Authoritarian style and disconnection-rejection area 04.68 0.110 0.010 -0.110 48.84 0.03

Authoritative style and disconnection-rejection area 09.44 0.161 0.026 -0.160 65.33 0.00

Permissive style and autonomy and performance 00.68 0.040 0.000 -0.040 39.91 0.40

Authoritarian style and autonomy and performance 00.86 0.040 0.000 -0.049 39.80 0.35

Authoritative style and autonomy and performance 00.49 0.030 0.000 -0.030 44.25 0.48

Permissive style and impaired limits 00.41 0.030 0.000 -0.030 26.91 0.52

Authoritarian style and impaired limits 00.15 0.020 0.000 -0.020 28.34 0.69

Authoritative style and impaired limits 00.76 0.040 0.000 -0.040 29.41 0.38

Permissive style and other-direction area 00.79 0.040 0.000 -0.040 28.04 0.37

Authoritarian style and other-direction area 12.68 0.180 0.030 -0.180 23.01 0.00

Authoritative style and other-direction area 07.86 0.140 0.020 -0.140 31.27 0.00

Permissive style and over-vigilance/inhibition area 00.17 0.020 0.000 -0.020 31.22 0.67

Authoritarian style and over-vigilance/inhibition area 00.05 0.010 0.000 -0.010 30.91 0.82

Authoritative style and over-vigilance/inhibition area 00.66 0.040 0.000 -0.040 32.15 0.41

5. Discussion
Results showed that some of Baumrind’s parenting 

styles are predictors of early maladaptive schemas. In 
addition, the results revealed that Baumrind’s authorita-
tive parenting style is a negative predictor of schemas in 
the area of rejection or disconnection. To explain these 
results using Young’s approach, we can say that parents 
with Baumrind’s authoritative parenting style have some 
features such as being warm and friendly, allowing chil-
dren to express their own opinions, and being reasonable 
in expressing their demands. Hence, the schemas of this 
area created by rejection, abuse, and unstable, cold, and 
heartless manners are not effective parenting styles. On 
the other hand, the authoritative style is a negative pre-
dictor of schemas in the area of other-direction. As a re-
sult, the schemas of this area for parenting styles, which 
parents need to prioritize, did not meet the children’s 
demands.

Another finding of this study was that the authoritarian 
parenting style is a good predictor of schemas in the ar-
eas of other-direction and rejection/disconnection. To ex-
plain these results, we can say that parents with authori-
tarian parenting style provide a base for schemas in the 
area of rejection/disconnection, the area that does not 
consider the child’s need for love and safety; thus, their 
families are unstable, cold, ostracized, and isolated. The 
results show that parenting style is a predictor of sche-
mas in the area of other-direction. Furthermore, we can 
say that because the authoritarian style possesses the 
characteristics of low acceptance and lack of attention to 
the emotional needs of the child, it causes a schema in 
the area of other-direction that emanates from neglect-
ing children’s needs (10). The results of this study have 

been confirmed by the studies by Young et al. (10), Gunty 
and Buri (16), Esmali (19), and Shahamat et al. (20).

In conclusion, conducting a research on people who 
have different educational levels, live in various regions, 
and have different cultural expressions is recommended. 
The limitations of this study include the use of a self-re-
port tool (questionnaire) and a student sample; therefore, 
the results are not applicable to other communities. Rec-
ommendations are made to improve the quality of future 
research in the area of association of attachment styles 
and early maladaptive schema with parenting styles.
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