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Abstract

Background: Vitiligo is a common skin disorder characterized by the loss of skin pigment, which can significantly impact

individuals' health-related quality of life (HRQoL), particularly in women. Body dysmorphic disorder (BDD) and depressive

symptoms are common psychological comorbidities associated with vitiligo.

Objectives: This study aimed to investigate the relationship between BDD, depressive symptoms, and HRQoL in women with

vitiligo.

Methods: A cross-sectional study was conducted in Ahvaz, Iran, in 2023, involving a sample of 152 women with vitiligo. The

study population included all women with vitiligo who presented to dermatology or cosmetic clinics in Ahvaz during that year.

Data were collected using the MOS 36-item Short-Form Health Survey (SF-36), the Multidimensional Body-Self Relations

Questionnaire (MBSRQ), and the Beck Depression Inventory (BDI). Pearson's correlation and regression analyses were used to

assess the relationships between variables. Data analysis was conducted using SPSS-27 software.

Results: Women with vitiligo had a mean health-related quality of life score of (58.13 ± 11.50). Their mean score on the body

dysmorphic disorder assessment was (99.61 ± 37.33), and the mean depressive symptom score was (20.25 ± 4.47). Significant

negative correlations were found between BDD and HRQoL, as well as between depressive symptoms and HRQoL, in women with

vitiligo (P < 0.001). Multiple regression analysis showed that BDD and depressive symptoms independently predicted HRQoL (P

< 0.001).

Conclusions: Body dysmorphic disorder and depressive symptoms are significantly associated with impaired HRQoL in

women with vitiligo. Screening for and treating BDD and depressive symptoms may improve HRQoL in this population.
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1. Background

The skin serves as a vital defense mechanism against

the invasion of microorganisms, chemicals, and other

environmental hazards (1, 2). Disruptions to this barrier,
manifesting as various skin diseases, can lead to

infections and other health complications (3). Moreover,
skin conditions can significantly affect individuals'

quality of life, impacting both their physical and

psychological well-being (4). Vitiligo is one such
autoimmune skin disease, characterized by the loss of

pigment-producing cells (melanocytes) in specific areas
of the skin, resulting in visible white patches (5). It is

estimated to affect 0.5 - 1% of the global population, with

no racial or ethnic predilection (6). While several types

of vitiligo exist, the most common forms are segmental

vitiligo (affecting one side or a limited area of the body)
and generalized vitiligo (affecting multiple areas of the

body) (7).

Among skin diseases, pigmentary disorders are

particularly significant, and vitiligo is considered one of
the most common of these disorders (8). Vitiligo

involves the destruction of pigment-producing cells in

the skin and hair for unknown reasons, leading to a
failure to produce pigment and resulting in white

patches due to the loss of skin pigmentation (9, 10). The
diagnosis of vitiligo can have a profound impact on an

individual's health-related quality of life (HRQoL) (11).

The World Health Organization (WHO) defines

HRQoL as an individual's perception of their position in

https://doi.org/10.5812/jcrps-148595
https://doi.org/10.5812/jcrps-148595
https://doi.org/10.5812/jcrps-148595
https://crossmark.crossref.org/dialog/?doi=10.5812/jcrps-148595&domain=pdf
https://crossmark.crossref.org/dialog/?doi=10.5812/jcrps-148595&domain=pdf
https://orcid.org/0009-0002-8876-1367
https://orcid.org/0009-0002-8876-1367
https://orcid.org/0000-0003-0505-0501
https://orcid.org/0000-0003-0505-0501
mailto:nooriimelika@gmail.com


Noori M and Johari Fard R Brieflands

2 J Clin Res Paramed Sci. 2024; 13(2): e148595

life within the context of their culture and value system,

and in relation to their goals, expectations, standards,

and concerns (12). This definition of HRQoL
encompasses three components: Subjective well-being,

functional status, and contextual factors, with the first
two components overlapping with mental health

quality of life (13). health-related quality of life can be

used as a predictor of the severity and impact of
diseases, injuries, and disabilities, as well as a measure

to assess mental health in populations (14, 15).

Body dysmorphic disorder (BDD) is another factor

that significantly impacts the HRQoL of individuals with
vitiligo (16). Body image transcends personal identity; it

acts as a cornerstone of social identity, shaping how we
interact with the world and how others perceive us (17).

Dissatisfaction with one's body image, particularly in a

condition like vitiligo with visible skin changes, can lead
to a significant decline in both mental health and

HRQoL (18). Our perception of our body is a complex
interplay between physical characteristics and

psychological interpretation, which profoundly
influences our ability to connect with others (19). A
negative body image can lead to social anxiety and a

distorted perception of how others view us, potentially
fostering social isolation and reducing the quality of

social interactions. This can have a cascading effect,
impacting self-worth and confidence in social

situations. Yarmohammadi et al. (20) support this

notion by demonstrating a positive correlation between
body image and HRQoL in their research. Conversely,

they found an inverse relationship between obsessive
beliefs, often a core feature of BDD, and HRQoL.

Depression is another significant factor negatively
impacting the HRQoL of women with vitiligo (21, 22).

While depression can be a natural response to various
life stressors (23), it often goes beyond this simplistic

explanation. Extensive research demonstrates a strong

and complex association between depression and
vitiligo (24, 25). Women with vitiligo experience

depressive symptoms at a considerably higher rate
compared to the general population (26). This increased

vulnerability to depression can be attributed to several

factors related to the presence of vitiligo. Social stigma
and discrimination due to the visible nature of vitiligo

can be a major source of stress, contributing to feelings
of isolation and alienation (27). Body image disturbance,

a common consequence of vitiligo, often leads to

dissatisfaction and potentially decreased self-esteem.
This negative self-perception can create a cycle of

anxiety and depression, further impacting HRQoL.
Additionally, the chronic nature of vitiligo and the

psychological stress of managing the condition can

contribute to depressive symptoms (28).

While vitiligo primarily manifests as visible skin

discoloration, its impact extends far beyond the
physical. Many patients with dermatological conditions,

including vitiligo, experience symptoms related to

distorted body image or psychological distress, such as
non-organic itchiness, pain, and burning sensations.

These psychogenic symptoms non-organic sensory
experiences, BDD, depression, and anxiety can

significantly impact patients' quality of life, causing

distress, hindering daily functioning, and increasing
healthcare resource utilization. Despite the recognized

association between psychological factors and vitiligo,
research specifically exploring the link between BDD,

depression, and HRQoL in women with vitiligo remains

limited. Addressing this gap is crucial for improving the
overall well-being of women with vitiligo.

2. Objectives

Based on this background, the present study aimed

to investigate the relationship between BDD, depressive
symptoms, and HRQoL in women with vitiligo.

3. Methods

3.1. Study Design and Participants

The present study was a descriptive correlational

investigation. The statistical population consisted of all

women with vitiligo who visited dermatology and
cosmetic clinics in Ahvaz, Iran, in 2023. To ensure

adequate statistical power and generalizability of the
findings, a minimum sample size per predictor variable

was recommended (29). Considering the number of

independent variables in this study, the potential for
participant attrition, and the desire for statistically
robust results, a sample size of 150 participants was
deemed necessary. Using a convenience sampling

method, 165 female patients with vitiligo were selected.

Inclusion criteria included a diagnosis of vitiligo by a

dermatologist, willingness to participate in the study
and provide informed consent, and no history of

psychotherapy. Exclusion criteria included

unwillingness to continue participation and incomplete
questionnaires. Ultimately, after excluding incomplete

questionnaires, data from 152 participants were
analyzed.

To ensure ethical compliance, participant
confidentiality and anonymity were strictly maintained.

All data collection and analysis procedures were
anonymized, and no personally identifiable
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information was collected. The results are reported

solely in aggregate form to protect individual privacy
and prevent any potential disclosure that could violate
personal boundaries.

3.2. Data Collection

3.2.1. The MOS 36-item Short-Form Health Survey (SF-36)

The SF-36 was developed by Ware (30) and consists of

36 items divided into 8 components: Physical

functioning, role limitations due to physical health
problems, role limitations due to emotional problems,

energy and fatigue, emotional well-being, social
functioning, pain, and general health. Scores on this

questionnaire range from 0 to 100, with lower scores

indicating poorer quality of life. Scores are classified
into four levels: Less than 45 indicates very poor quality
of life, 45 - 60 indicates poor quality, 60 - 75 indicates
good quality, and above 75 indicates desirable quality.

Brazier et al. (31) reported a total test reliability of 0.85.
In the current study, Cronbach's alpha was used to

determine the reliability of the SF-36, yielding a value of

0.84.

3.2.2. The Multidimensional Body-Self Relations
Questionnaire (MBSRQ)

The MBSRQ was developed by Cash (32) and consists
of 46 items rated on a 5-point scale, ranging from very
dissatisfied (1) to very satisfied (5). This questionnaire
assesses appearance evaluation, appearance orientation,

fitness evaluation, fitness orientation, mental weight,

and satisfaction with body areas. The Persian version of
the MBSRQ demonstrated high internal consistency,

with a Cronbach's alpha coefficient of 0.98 (33). In the
current study, Cronbach's alpha was used to evaluate the

reliability of the MBSRQ , yielding a value of 0.81.

3.2.3. The Beck Depression Inventory (BDI)

The BDI is a widely used 21-item self-report
questionnaire developed by Beck (34) to assess the

severity of depressive symptoms. It is one of the most

common psychometric tools for measuring depression.
Each item on the BDI is rated on a 4-point Likert scale

from 0 to 3, with total scores ranging from 0 to 63.
Higher scores indicate more severe depressive

symptoms. Farzadkia et al. (35) established the internal

consistency of the questionnaire using Cronbach's
alpha, yielding a coefficient of 0.87. In the present study,

the Cronbach's alpha coefficient for the BDI was 0.88,
indicating good internal consistency.

3.3. Data Analysis

The data collected in this study were analyzed using
SPSS-27 software. Descriptive statistics, including means

and standard deviations, were used to summarize the
data. Pearson's correlation coefficient and stepwise

regression analysis were employed for inferential

statistical analysis.

4. Results

The sample consisted of women with vitiligo. In
terms of educational attainment, 58 participants

(38.16%) reported having a university education, while
94 participants (61.84%) had a high school education.

Regarding age distribution, the majority (69.08%) were

between 20 and 35 years old, with the remaining 30.92%
between 35 and 50 years old. Employment status

revealed that 59.87% (n = 91) of the participants were
housewives, while 40.13% (n = 61) were employed.

Marital status distribution showed that 54.61% (n = 83) of

the participants were single, while 45.39% (n = 69) were
married. Table 1 presents the mean and standard

deviation (SD) of the research variables.

Table 2 presents the correlation coefficients between

the study variables. Significant negative correlations
were observed between BDD symptoms and HRQoL (r = -

0.41, P < 0.001), as well as between depressive symptoms
and HRQoL (r = - 0.37, P < 0.001) in women with vitiligo.

These findings indicate that higher levels of BDD

symptoms and depressive symptoms are associated
with lower HRQoL scores.

Body dysmorphic disorder was the strongest

predictor of HRQoL in the first model. The correlation

coefficient between BDD and HRQoL was -0.38,
accounting for 24% of the variance in health-related

quality of life in women with vitiligo. Depressive
symptoms were added in the second model, and the

combined correlation coefficient of these two variables

with HRQoL was -0.32, accounting for 36% of the variance
in HRQoL in women with vitiligo (Table 3).

5. Discussion

The present study aimed to investigate the

relationship between BDD, depression, and HRQoL in
women with vitiligo. The findings indicated multiple

relationships between these variables. The first finding
was that HRQoL could be predicted based on BDD in

women with vitiligo. This result aligns with the studies

by Barberis et al. (36) and Chee et al. (37).

This can be explained by the fact that BDD refers to a
negative perception of one's body shape and size, which
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Table 1. Mean and Standard Deviation of the Research Variables

Variables Mean ± SD

Health-related quality of life 58.13 ± 11.50

Body dysmorphic disorder 99.61 ± 37.33

Depressive symptoms 20.25 ± 4.47

Table 2. Pearson Correlation Coefficients of the Research Variables

Variables
Health-Related Quality of Life

r P

Body dysmorphic disorder -0.41 0.001

Depressive symptoms -0.37 0.001

can have both physical and psychological consequences
(38). Individuals with body dysmorphic disorder may
struggle with self-acceptance, experience social

rejection, and suffer from negative psychological effects
(39). Women with vitiligo, beyond the physical

symptoms, may worry about their appearance, leading
to significant limitations in their work, emotional and

social relationships, self-esteem, and overall quality of

life (21). Furthermore, psychological issues such as
anxiety and depression are more common in these

patients (22). Given these results, it is important for
psychological counselors and physicians to address

both the psychological problems and the quality of life

of these patients, alongside the physical aspects of
vitiligo.

The second finding indicated that HRQoL could also

be predicted based on depression in women with

vitiligo. This finding is consistent with studies by
Sakkaki et al. (40) and Fernandes et al. (41). Sakkaki et al.

(40) found a significant relationship between
depression and health-related quality of life, and

Fernandes et al. (41) similarly reported a significant

relationship between depression and quality of life.

This finding can be explained by the fact that vitiligo
patients experience both physical and psychological

symptoms, which may contribute to the development of

depression (21). These patients often endure more severe
depressive symptoms and a decline in quality of life.

Depression typically results in decreased performance,
fatigue, an inability to carry out daily activities, suicidal

thoughts, and a further reduction in quality of life (42).

Overall, depression plays a significant role in
diminishing HRQoL in vitiligo patients (43). Given that

vitiligo is a chronic disease with substantial physical
and psychological impacts on daily life, a decrease in

HRQoL in these patients is predictable.

In general, vitiligo patients suffer from various
psychological, physical, familial, social, and economic

challenges. This can lead to a serious decline in

individual and social interactions, causing depression,
which in turn further reduces their HRQoL. health-

related quality of life can serve as a predictor of the
extent and impact of diseases, injuries, and disabilities,

as well as a measure of mental health in patients (40).

Health status, functional ability, happiness, maintaining
critical bodily functions, and freedom from pain are key
indicators of HRQoL. These indicators are often lacking
in vitiligo patients, contributing to the onset of

depression.

This study has several limitations that should be

acknowledged to guide future research efforts. First, the
investigation focused on women with vitiligo in Ahvaz,

Iran. Therefore, caution is required when generalizing

the findings to other populations with vitiligo,
particularly in different geographical locations.

Additionally, the study did not explore the potential
influence of cultural factors on the investigated

variables (HRQoL, BDD, and depression). Culture can

significantly impact perceptions of health, body image,
and mental well-being. Future research should consider

incorporating culturally sensitive measures and designs
to explore how cultural background moderates or

mediates the relationships observed in this study.

Beyond cultural factors, several other avenues

warrant exploration in future research. Longitudinal
studies could offer valuable insights into the dynamic

interplay between BDD, depression, and HRQoL in

women with vitiligo. Investigating potential
moderators and mediators of these relationships could

help identify specific factors that exacerbate or buffer
the negative impact of vitiligo on mental health and

quality of life. For example, exploring the role of social
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Table 3. Multiple Regression Analysis Indices for Predicting Health-Related Quality of Life Based on Body Dysmorphic Disorder and Depressive Symptoms

Models Predictor Variables F R R2 B β t P

1 Body dysmorphic disorder 71.01 0.49 0.24 0.38 0.38 4.22 0.001

2 Body dysmorphic disorder and depressive symptoms 60.27 0.60 0.36 -0.32 -0.37 -6.66 0.001

support networks, coping mechanisms, and access to

mental health services could provide valuable
information for developing targeted interventions to

improve well-being in this population.

5.1. Conclusions

This study highlights the significant negative
associations between BDD, depressive symptoms, and

HRQoL in women with vitiligo. The findings suggest that
BDD and depression act as independent risk factors,

potentially contributing to a downward spiral in HRQoL

for women with vitiligo. The observed negative
correlations imply that women experiencing symptoms

of either BDD, depression, or both are more likely to
report lower overall well-being. Furthermore, the

independent contributions of BDD and depression to

HRQoL, as revealed by the regression analysis,
underscore the critical need for comprehensive

treatment approaches that address both conditions.
These results move beyond simply documenting co-

occurrence, suggesting a potential causal pathway
linking BDD, depression, and HRQoL in women with
vitiligo. By integrating psychological interventions

targeting BDD and depression alongside traditional
vitiligo treatment plans, healthcare professionals can

work towards improving the overall well-being of

women with this condition. The findings emphasize the
importance of a holistic approach that addresses both

the physical manifestations and the psychological
consequences of vitiligo.
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